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Call Order 300 (31674B)
N-12, BAZILE CREEK BRIDGE

This proposal does not have any submitted bids.

Call Order 305 (32278)
S54D, SANTEE SOUTH BRIDGE

$1,376,077.24 0774 No Bid Bond ID DIXON CONSTRUCTION CO.
$1,597,744.19 0805 No Bid Bond ID A.M. COHRON & SON, INC.
$1,616,339.25 1742 No Bid Bond ID HERBST CONSTRUCTION, INC.
$1,767,631.86 C004 No Bid Bond ID JJK CONSTRUCTION, LLC
$2,508,400.75 E079 No Bid Bond ID LOBATO CONSTRUCTION, LLC

Call Order 400 (42854)
I-80, MINDEN - GIBBON

$7,780,367.35 3204 No Bid Bond ID WERNER CONSTRUCTION LLC

Call Order 405 (42897)
DISTRICT 4 - DISTRICTWIDE BRIDGES

$6,812,575.90 3919 No Bid Bond ID JMN CONSTRUCTION, LLC
$7,532,274.68 1148 No Bid Bond ID IOWA CIVIL CONTRACTING, INC.
$7,684,437.03 1847 No Bid Bond ID GENERAL EXCAVATING LLC

$7,773,485.33 1613 No Bid Bond ID
M. E. COLLINS CONTRACTING COMPANY,
INC.

$9,589,000.00 2853 No Bid Bond ID SIMON CONTRACTORS INC.

Call Order 500 (51614)
N-2, BOX BUTTE/SHERIDAN CO. LINE EAST

$8,402,848.81 3204 No Bid Bond ID WERNER CONSTRUCTION LLC
$9,923,984.37 0477 No Bid Bond ID WESTERN ENGINEERING COMPANY, INC.

Call Order 600 (61667)
US-183, ANSLEY NORTH

$6,211,464.28 3204 No Bid Bond ID WERNER CONSTRUCTION LLC
$6,956,436.15 0477 No Bid Bond ID WESTERN ENGINEERING COMPANY, INC.
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Call Order 800 (81088)
TAYLOR WEST

$459,043.00 1749 No Bid Bond ID VAN KIRK SAND & GRAVEL, INC.
$459,902.04 0306 No Bid Bond ID MIDWEST INFRASTRUCTURE, INC.
$504,106.20 C548 No Bid Bond ID NORTH CONSTRUCTION LLC
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