

**Call Order 100 (1411X)**

N-2 AND US-75 NEAR NEBRASKA CITY

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$147,684.00	3168	No Bid Bond ID	SCODELLER CONSTRUCTION, INC.
\$197,560.00	2997	No Bid Bond ID	MIDWEST COATINGS COMPANY, INC. AND BAS HOLDING, LLC

**Call Order 105 (1401)**

US-75, AUBURN NORTH

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$3,265,453.79	0574	No Bid Bond ID	CONSTRUCTORS, INC.
\$3,747,353.68	3816	No Bid Bond ID	K2 REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT, LLC

**Call Order 110 (1247Y)**

27TH/FAIRFIELD &amp; W. O ST. BRS., LINCOLN

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$3,466,339.43	3816	No Bid Bond ID	K2 REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT, LLC
\$3,836,904.52	0574	No Bid Bond ID	CONSTRUCTORS, INC.
\$4,164,556.18	2406	No Bid Bond ID	WILDCAT CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.

**Call Order 200 (2209)**

US-75, MURRAY - PLATTSMOUTH

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$44,396,375.44	0049	No Bid Bond ID	HAWKINS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
\$47,012,390.33	0574	No Bid Bond ID	CONSTRUCTORS, INC.
\$48,613,404.12	3556	No Bid Bond ID	KOSS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
\$50,764,753.09	3652	No Bid Bond ID	CEDAR VALLEY PAVING, LLC
\$51,769,916.22	3135	No Bid Bond ID	C. J. MOYNA & SONS, LLC

**Call Order 205 (2704X)**

US-75, BLAIR - HERMAN

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$10,267,128.68	0574	No Bid Bond ID	CONSTRUCTORS, INC.
\$13,305,141.15	3816	No Bid Bond ID	K2 REAL ESTATE DEVELOPMENT, LLC

**Call Order 300 (32381)**

N-9, E. JCT. US-20 - N-12

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$9,988,781.33	3245	No Bid Bond ID	KNIFE RIVER CORPORATION DBA KNIFE RIVER MIDWEST
\$10,777,407.36	0574	No Bid Bond ID	CONSTRUCTORS, INC.

**Call Order 305 (3137)**

US-20, NORTH OF DIXON - SOUTH OF MARTINSBURG

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$10,535,120.42	3245	No Bid Bond ID	KNIFE RIVER CORPORATION DBA KNIFE RIVER MIDWEST
\$12,210,846.12	0574	No Bid Bond ID	CONSTRUCTORS, INC.
\$13,354,659.51	0086	No Bid Bond ID	HENNINGSEN CONST., INC.

**Call Order 310 (3280)**

N-121, CROFTON NORTH

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$4,429,814.82	3245	No Bid Bond ID	KNIFE RIVER CORPORATION DBA KNIFE RIVER MIDWEST
\$4,872,460.35	0574	No Bid Bond ID	CONSTRUCTORS, INC.
\$5,246,571.77	0083	No Bid Bond ID	WERNER CONSTRUCTION, INC.

**Call Order 400 (0959X)**

STATEWIDE LIGHTING

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$325,550.50	4695	No Bid Bond ID	IES HOLDINGS, INC.
\$396,753.55	2122	No Bid Bond ID	WATTS ELECTRIC COMPANY

**Call Order 500 (5443)**

US-385, L-62A NORTH

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$31,999,999.99	C499	No Bid Bond ID	SCOTT CONTRACTING, INC.
\$34,103,201.94	3519	No Bid Bond ID	INTERSTATE HIGHWAY CONSTRUCTION, INC.
\$35,051,897.66	0083	No Bid Bond ID	WERNER CONSTRUCTION, INC.
\$35,162,851.67	3556	No Bid Bond ID	KOSS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

**Call Order 600 (68232)**

N-97, TRYON - MULLEN

<u>Bid Amount</u>	<u>Bidder ID</u>	<u>Bond ID</u>	<u>Vendor Name</u>
\$10,360,006.54	2252	No Bid Bond ID	PAULSEN, INC.